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ISSUES OF COMPLIANCE I N  

EMDR 


1) THE BOUNDARIES OF THE 
THERAPIST'S ABILITY SHOULD 
NOTBE DESIGNATEDAS LIMITA- 
TIONS OF THE CLIENT 

Too often the limitations of the 
therapist's model, repertoire of inter- 
ventions, or ability to interact with the 
client are dismissed as due to client 
"resistance." While client resistance 
and non-compliance may certainly be 
issues that need to be overcome, the 
interaction between theclient and the 
clinician should not be discounted as  
possibly contributing to the lack of the 
therapeutic effect. 

In EMDR, the therapist variables that 
impact upon the treatment effect in- 
clude the ability to target the appro- 
priate part of the pathology, order of 
targeting, and comfort with a multi- 
modal approach. For full therapeutic 
effect of EMDR. the therapist must be 
able to: (1)establish a level of rapport 
t,hat allows the client to comfortably 
experience revivification of trauma, 
(2) accurately identify the appropri- 
ate targets, (3) use insight and sensi- 
tivity to asslst in the completion of 
processing, (4) interweave a variety of 
coping skills, and system's informa- 

tion, and (5)offer appropriate model- 
ing when necessary. Fortunately, it 
is a client-centered approach that al- 
lows most of the work tobe done in the 
office. Therefore, non-compliance is 
often (of course, not always) based on 
inflexibility of the clinical approach 
and indicates the need for more ap- 
propriate targeting. 

2)NON-COMPLIANCE IS  PAR T OF 
THE PA ~ O L O C  Y 

In EMDR, pathology is the target of 
therapy. Non-compliance is not un- 
der the client's conscious control and 
is therefore not considered an ancil- 
lary issue. With this understanding, 
consequences of non-compliance be- 
come part of the debriefing of the 
client on an on-going basis. This al- 
lows the lack of compliance to be 
viewed as  part of the pathology that 
needs adjusting. We do not tell our 
clients to return for help when they 
are not so depressed-telling them to 
come back when they are more com- 
pliant often amounts to the same 
thing. 

3)CO- PARTICIPA TION IN DETER- 
MINING GOALS 

The therapistlclient relationship is 
an interaction which should incorpo- 
rate the specific goals of the client. 
The actual effects of non-compliance 
should be assessed. 

The positive or negative effects of any 
therapy will be based upon an inter- 
action ofclient, clinician, and method. 

Part of this interaction is the appro- 
priate selection of goals that are agreed 
upon by both client and clinician. 
If the client is being asked to re- 
experience disturbing aspects of the 
targeted traumas, the reasons should 
be acceptable to the client. While 
there can be no guarantees, clearly 
the reasons for choosing to experience 
the discomfort of reprocessing will 
include the possibility of liberation 
from the on-going debilitating effects 
of the trauma. The client must recog- 
nize these potential effects in order 
for the discomfort generated by the 
processing to be acceptable. 

The clinician's goals should be ap- 
proved ofby the client, and theclient's 
goals evaluated by the clinician as 
appropriate. For instance, never feel- 
ing angry while driving may be im- 
possible to achieve and may be part of 
an inappropriate self-assessment that 
underlies the reason for non-compli- 
ance (e.g., inability to succeed). Non- 
compliance should be coached as pre- 
venting the achievement of specific 
goals initiated by the client, not ones 
foisted upon him or her by the thera- 
pist. This increases the likelihood of 
managing the areas of resistance. . 

4) SECONDARY GAIN ISSUES 

Issues underlying non-compliance in- 
clude fear of success, fear of terminat- 
ing therapy, fear of failure, etc. Ap- 
propriate assessment can be made by 
asking the client to respond to the 
question, "What would happen if you 
are successful?" After any appropri- 
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ate fears are adequately addressed, 
any residual feeling of tension or re- 
sistance can then be targeted with 
EMDR in order to reprocess any inap- 
propriate fears. Fears of losing ben- 
efitsshould be addressed as  a realistic 
fear before investigating the possible 
pathogenic basis (e.g., I cannot suc- 
ceed if I try). Unless secondary gains 
are appropriately identified and ad- 
dressed, little therapeutic progress 
can be made. 
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5) PRIORITlZING OF TARGETS 

geted before processing the targets 
that  underlay the primary presenting 
complaint. As with other EMDR pro- 

Therapeutically, fears must be ad- 
dressed in terms of appropriateness 
and in the sequence of pathological 
blocks. 

S p e ~ ~ c a l l y ,  the EMDR model calls 
for the sequential targeting of appro- 
priate memories that  impact upon the 
pathology. The order in which these 
targets is accessed and processed is 
significant (e.g., memories having to 
do with lack of worth should be tar- 
geted before memories having to do 
with fear of failure). If blocking be- 
liefs are not appropriately addressed, 

the therapeutic effect will be ques- 
tionable. 

As previously stated, EMDR calls for 
directly addressing the appropriate- 
ness of fears. When the fear appears 
to be based on "consensus reality" 
issues such as the loss of a disability 
check if the PTSD is handled, an ac- 
tion plan for substituting an appro- 
priate source of livelihood should be 
inaugurated before targeting the ac- 
tual dysfunction. When appropriate 
fears are addressed through the in- 
clusion of new information, coping 
skills, etc., then the residual fears are 
viewed a s  appropriate targets for re- 
processing. After these have been 
addressed, the trauma targets may be 
approached more effectively. 

6) GENESIS OF FEARS 

Non-compliance should be evaluated 
in termsof spiritual beliefs (e.g., life is 
suffering), parental injunctions or 
need toremain loyal to parents through 
parallel suffering, manipulation and 
power needs. Appropriate memories 
underlying these factors may be tar- 

tocols, after the memories have been 
reprocessed, the present stimuli that 
elicit the negative d e c t  or behavior 
should be targeted and processed. In 
addition, a positive template for ap- 
propriate action should be installed. 
With issues of non-compliance, the 
client should be asked to imagine do- 
ing the task easily and comfortably. 
Targeting with EMDR allows the be- 
havioral possibilities to become more 
enhanced and allows any residualfeel- 
ings of discomfort to be reprocessed 

The experiences and actual behavior 
of non-compliance can often be tar- 
geted by EMDR. Many rehearsalscan 
be accomplished in the oifice. 

In EMDR, a feedback Log is useful for 
reprocessing stimuli. After a trauma 
is addressed, the client is asked to 
report back on any disruptive feelings 
or experiences for further targeting. 
Ironically, excluding the refusal to 
engage in the treatment itself, this 
Log is the major source of non-compli- 
ance in EMDR treatment and can be 
used as  an appropriate reprocessing 
target. S p e ~ ~ c a l l y ,  the feelings of re- 
sistance to t.he task, along with any 
negative cognition and salient memo- 
ries, should be addressed as  they arise 
within the offlce. Results are then 
reported back in vivo. 

In sum, in attending to issues of non- 
compliance, the choice of treatment 
should be flexible enough to work 
around the client resistance until it is 
resolved. This can often be accom- 
plished with EMDR, since most of the 
work is done during the treatment 
session. 
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